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Janitorial Training Programs Now Available at TheJanitorialStore.com 
 
 

TheJanitorialStore.com is happy to announce the release of its janitorial training programs.  
The programs provide an affordable opportunity for small and individually owned cleaning 
companies to get professional quality training for their employees. With over 20 years of 
professional commercial cleaning experience, the staff at TheJanitorialStore.com has developed 
the "Cleaning to Perfection" series of janitorial training programs. The programs include step 
by step instructions on how to clean, as well as information on common complaints, how to 
prepare for the job, the importance of small details, a review and training log.  Titles that are 
now available include: General Cleaning, Hard Floor Care, Carpet Spotting, Window Cleaning 
and the Janitorial Safety Program. The training programs can be purchased in PDF, PowerPoint 
or printed versions.  
 
According to Jean Hanson, co-owner of TheJantitorialStore.com, “inconsistent training is the 
most common reason for customer complaints”. These training programs give cleaning 
companies a way to provide all of their employees with consistent training, ensuring that all 
tasks are being completed to their customers’ satisfaction.  
 
In addition to training programs, TheJanitorialStore.com has other quality products to assist 
cleaning company owners become successful in the business including the following e-books: 
Cleaning Company Policy Manual and Employee Handbook, Home Office Procedures Manual for 
Cleaning Companies, and Marketing and Sales Success for Cleaning Companies.  
 
The Janitorial Store is a subscription web site that gives owners of small commercial cleaning 
companies an opportunity to share knowledge, ask questions, participate in tele-seminars, find 
training programs, and read articles designed just for start-up, small, and growing cleaning 
companies. 
 
For more information or to schedule a personal tour of all that TheJanitorialStore.com has to 
offer, contact Jean Hanson at 218-855-1854, or visit www.thejanitorialstore.com and complete 
the contact form at www.thejanitorialstore.com/public/7.cfm. 
 
TheJanitorialStore.com founders are available for interviews; contact Jean Hanson at 218-855-
1854 to schedule interviews. 
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