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Synergistic Software Solutions Helps Bailiwick Take IT Project 
Management to a New Level with Sage MAS 500 ERP Solution

Minneapolis, MN, Dec. 4, 2006—Synergistic Software Solutions, LLC, a software and services provider 
representing Sage Software mid-market business management solutions, announced today that it helped 
Bailiwick Data Systems, Inc., implement a new Sage MAS 500 accounting and ERP solution. The system 
helps Bailiwick manage large-scale IT projects that encompass a complex coordination of people, materi-
als and equipment. Bailiwick’s customers include some of the country’s largest retailers who often roll out 
hundreds of sites simultaneously. Using the solution, Bailiwick has an accurate and current picture of the 
profitability and status of each of its projects.

According to Missy Carbonneau, a business analyst at Bailiwick, “Many of our projects are large scale, and 
fast-paced with lots of complexity. With our new solution, we have measurement tools that allow us to 
analyze business processes and see what’s effective and profitable and what isn’t.”

Bailiwick Data Systems, Inc. (Bailiwick) is a Chaska, Minnesota based company specializing in the deploy-
ment of Information Technology solutions for its clients throughout the U.S.A. Since its founding in 1995, 
Bailiwick has continually grown its client, partner and project base to provide solutions for the most tech-
nically challenging and aggressively scheduled projects. Bailiwick serves many different markets including 
nation-wide retailers with store openings and renovations, in addition to financial services companies, 
manufacturing companies, high-technology deployments and self-service kiosks. To learn more about their 
experience and expertise, visit their website at www.bailiwick.com or call 952-556-5569.

A complete case study about Bailiwick is now available for download from the Synergistic Software Solu-
tions Web site at www.synergistic-us.com.

About Synergistic Software
Synergistic Software Solutions, LLC is a wholly-owned subsidiary of BDO Seidman, LLP, and an Authorized 
Sage Select Business Partner representing Sage MAS 90, 200 and 500 ERP products. Synergistic is based in 
Minneapolis, MN and has been serving clients for over 23 years with specific expertise in manufacturing 
and distribution solutions. Synergistic provides business management software and services that allow 
organizations the ability to unify disparate systems and processes into a single, integrated platform. Syn-
ergistic works closely with clients to deliver practical, expert advice and innovative solutions that stream-
line processes improve productivity and help optimize client relationships. For more information and to 
request a free needs analysis and demonstration, visit www.synergistic-us.com or call 612.367.7300 or 
800.828.5126.
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IT Deployment Services Provider Bailiwick Helps Big Box Retailers Get Wired with Electronic 
Infrastructure, Point-of-Sale Equipment, Information Kiosks and More


