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Function specific DOT Hazmat Training for Dealerships  

KPA released a new online industry and function specific Department of Transportation 
(DOT) Hazardous Materials training (hazmat training) course as part of its 
Environmental, Health, and Safety (EHS) program for dealerships. 

December 9, 2009 (Lafayette, CO) – DOT 49 CFR, Part 172, Subpart H, requires that 
all hazmat employees who affect hazardous materials transportation are trained within 
90 days of hire, with recurring training required at least once every three years. With 
fines up to $50,000, Hazmat enforcement can be tough and necessary training should 
be scheduled accordingly. 

DOT regulations require that employees are presented with 3 modules: General 
Awareness Training, Security Training, and Function-Specific Training. KPA’s new DOT 
Hazmat training stands out on the latter, the function-specific training.   

“This function specific training will allow Hazmat Employees to complete only the 
training they need. They no longer need to take lectures unrelated to their job functions, 
thus saving valuable time and getting them back to work sooner,” explain Peter Zaidel, 
product manager at KPA. “Examples of function specific training include air shipments, 
working with hazardous waste shipments, documentation and filling out shipping 
papers, packaging, marking and labeling hazardous materials, loading, unloading, 
blocking, bracing, segregation, driving, and incident reporting for a parts vehicle.” 

At the request of KPA’s clients, the new online training was made industry specific by 
closely matching examples and interactive exercises with the tasks employees may 
have to perform as part of their job duties. These exercises will allow employees to 
practice what they’ve learned in a virtual environment and ensure they are able to 
perform Hazmat tasks like packaging, filling out shipping papers, and shipping by air 
hazardous materials like airbags, seat belt pretensioners and other products. Finally, 
the course gives access to resources and shortcuts that will help hazmat employees 
perform their functions more easily including online access to hazmat shipping guides, 
and links to DOT resources. 

A free recorded webinar on DOT Hazardous Materials shipping presented by Peter 
Zaidel is available on the KPA website.  The webinar is part of KPA’s EHS and HR 

http://www.kpaonline.com/
http://www.kpaonline.com/ehs/dot/DOT-hazmat-training.html
http://www.fmcsa.dot.gov/rules-regulations/administration/fmcsr/fmcsrruletext.aspx?chunkKey=090163348004751d
http://www.kpaonline.com/ehs/dot/DOT-hazmat-training.html
http://www.kpaonline.com/ehs/dot/DOT-hazmat-training.html
http://forms.kpaonline.com/go/kpa/Recorded_Webinar_DOT_Hazmat


monthly compliance webinar series.  To register for any of KPA’s webinars go to 
http://www.kpaonline.com/webinars. 

 

About KPA 

At KPA, our business is to help you attain compliance with state and federal law; 
reducing your risk of accidents, fines, civil actions, and litigation while saving 
costs. Over 3000 clients trust KPA to provide the right combination of training, software, 
and expert advice. Endorsed by 24 national and state trade associations, KPA is the 
only provider of EHS and HR services and software designed for the specific 
requirements of dealerships, manufacturers, and automotive services companies. 

For more information please visit our website at www.kpaonline.com 
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