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8 March 2011 – MVP Systems Software, Inc., the leader in enterprise batch job scheduling and workload 
automation software, has introduced a new Users Support Forum.  After filling out a simple registration 
form, JAMS users can post questions, tips or suggestions, or just browse the site. The forum not only 
answers common user questions, but will be used to announce new JAMS capabilities, and gather 
feedback from users on any needed improvements.  The new community user forum can be accessed at 
www.JAMSSupport.com. 
 
“We are very pleased to offer this avenue of discussion to our loyal customers and end users,” states Rick 
Smith of MVP.  “Our users are a very knowledgeable and engaging bunch and we look forward to 
participating in some lively discussions about our products, the current industry climate and the future 
needs of our customers.”  The format of the JAMS Users Forum is easy to navigate, allowing users to find 
the topic threads they want to follow without delay. 
  
Also new to JAMSSupport.com is an interactive Frequently Asked Questions section. The FAQs cover 
installation, troubleshooting, operation and compatibility issues. Specific application notes have been 
added for the most popular applications used with JAMS, such as Ecometry, SAP, JDE and SQL.  The 
new FAQ section grew directly out of actual questions coming in to the MVP product support team.  
 
About MVP Systems Software, Inc. 
For more than 20 years, MVP Systems Software, Inc. has provided leading-edge batch job scheduling 
and workload automation solutions to its more than 750+ customers.  Customers include household 
names like JPMorgan Chase, Boeing, FINRA, Manulife Financial, Kaiser Permanente, The Hartford, and 
the US Postal Service.  MVP’s solutions are delivered in traditional software as well as SaaS models.   
 
About JAMS (Job Access and Management System) 
JAMS is the only job scheduling system built on a .NET framework.  JAMS is the first enterprise job 
scheduling system that can be leveraged by both IT Operations Personnel and Application Developers.  
With its roots in Windows, JAMS also supports running processes across a variety of operating systems 
(UNIX, Linux, iSeries, OpenVMS, etc.) and applications (SAP, SQL, Oracle, etc.)  To learn more about 
JAMS, please visit www.JAMSScheduler.com or call 800-261-JAMS. 
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