
Zoe and Piper started out on a whim, as 
a family jewelry business, back in 1997. 
Known as Taos Trading, we specialized 
in Native American handmade jewelry. 
We expanded our southwestern jewelry 
to include asian influences, whimsical 
pieces and traditional celtic symbols. 
Several years back, we decided to start 
making our own jewelry line, and that is 
when the creative juices started flowing. 
What a rush it is to buy handfuls and 
strands of beautiful gemstones! Being 
able to sort through and hand pick out 
the gemstones we use is an exhilarating 
high, and then being able to create 
jewelry with these items is the icing on 
the cake.

This year, we wanted to start a new line 
of sterling silver jewelry that showcased 
our style and philosophy... Zoe and Piper 
was born! The name is inspired by my 
daughter, Piper. If only we could see 
the world through a child's eyes, 
wouldn't it be a better place?

Our first pendants speak for 
themselves, literally. Our buddha 
pendant has words of inspiration written 
across the front and back: "Compassion, 
Karma, Peace, Love, Kindness, Respect 
and Tranquility" - words to live by. Our 
Herbivore pendant speaks out for 
Vegetarians, Vegans and Animals alike.

We are proud to donate a portion of our 
proceeds to select animal sanctuaries 
and advocacy groups. Working with and 
caring for animals has always been an 
important part of our lives, and this is 
our little way of giving back.

Piper
Hi, I'm Piper, the muse behind Zoe + 
Piper. I may be young, but I inspire all 
kinds of creativity and inspiration for 
my mom and my grandma (the 
creative forces behind Zoe + Piper). 
And as for Zoe... a little sister 
someday?
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