
 

 

MEDIA RELEASE 
 

Carson Dunlop Partners with Ratesheet.ca 
Carson Dunlop Homeowners Association Expands with the Addition of Ratesheet.ca 
 
June 13, 2013 (Toronto), Carson Dunlop has partnered with Ratesheet.ca to offer 
clients access to even more savings through the Carson Dunlop Homeowners 
Association. The Carson Dunlop Homeowners Association is the company’s not-for-
profit benefits program, aimed to help clients with their properties after they’ve had a 
Home Inspection performed. With the addition of Ratesheet.ca to the Association 
members, Carson Dunlop clients will now be able to save upwards of $10,000.  
 
“We are thrilled to partner with such a valuable company - Ratesheet.ca helps 
homeowners across Canada find the best mortgage rate available,” explained 
Graham Clarke, Vice President of Engineering at Carson Dunlop. “We believe in 
helping our clients save money while they protect their biggest investment, and 
Ratesheet.ca really substantiates that ideal.” 
 
“We are really excited about this new partnership between Carson Dunlop and 
Ratesheet.ca. Just like getting a home inspected can save a buyer from unexpected 
expenses, comparing mortgage rates can save unnecessary expenses,” said Vik 
Palan, President of Ratesheet.ca.  
 
When it comes to finding the best rates for your mortgage, Ratesheet.ca can 
potentially save you more than $5,000 over five years, and $30,000-plus over the 
course of your mortgage by comparing mortgage rates. This free service aims to 
illuminate the options available to homeowners by way of mortgage rates and 
mortgage brokers. Trusted by leading mortgage brokers and borrowers, 
Ratesheet.ca has assisted thousands of Canadians in their search for getting the 
best mortgage rates, and now they’re helping Carson Dunlop clients.  
 
To learn more about Carson Dunlop please visit carsondunlop.com. 
 
To learn more about the Carson Dunlop Homeowners Association please visit 
carsondunlop.com/homeowners-association. 
 
To learn more about Ratesheet.ca please visit ratesheet.ca. 
 
About Carson Dunlop 
Carson, Dunlop & Associates Ltd. has been a leading Consulting Engineering Firm 
devoted to building inspection since 1978. They are one of the largest independent 
Home Inspection companies in North America that leverages their extensive 
technical knowledge across six integrated business lines – Home Inspection, 



 

Commercial Inspection, Report Writing, Energy Audits, Home Inspector Training and 
Continuing Education. 

 
 

 
 
 


