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OnRamp Announces Partnership with Neverfail, Inc. 

AUSTIN, TX – OnRamp, a leading high security hosting provider with data center facilities in Texas and North 
Carolina, and Neverfail, a leading global supplier of IT continuity management software, announced a partnership 
to collectively assist customers in limiting the risk of downtime for critical business applications through the use of 
Neverfail’s suite of IT continuity software and OnRamp’s disaster recovery solutions. The news of this partnership 
closely follows the release of Neverfail’s IT Continuity Engine 7.0, in early February, and comes just days before 
the opening of OnRamp’s third data center facility, a 42,000 square foot facility in Austin, which will feature the 
highest levels of security, redundancy, reliability and infrastructure.  
 
OnRamp, a data center services provider with expertise in building, deploying and managing high security 
compliance solutions for colocation, managed hosting, private clouds and disaster recovery, assists customers in 
developing total business continuity plans by solving the challenges associated with replication, failover and 
failback. OnRamp’s Full7Layer Support goes above the network layer to help with anything and everything, from 
racking and stacking new equipment, to monitoring or repairing it on an ongoing basis. The fact that such deeply 
experienced OnRamp engineers are always available is especially important to disaster recovery customers, 
whose IT staff is far removed from their equipment by design, enabling them to effectively run remote IT 
environments and removing the need to travel between main offices and remote sites.  
 
Neverfail has helped thousands of customers worldwide protect their critical business applications by ensuring 
that they suffer no downtime. Neverfail’s suite of solutions will identify a business’s critical applications and any 
gaps in protection that could jeopardize their ability to meet SLAs in the event of a disaster. Businesses that 
deploy Neverfail’s IT continuity software can easily detect and respond to the broadest range of failures by 
automatically taking the most appropriate corrective action to keep critical applications up and running, no matter 
what the threat. 
 
Together, these leaders in business continuity understand the high-availability needs of businesses today, and 
have worked to develop solutions that account for natural, manmade and other disasters that may impact a 
business’s performance. “For businesses that cannot afford the down time, loss of productivity, and the resulting 
loss of data and revenue associated with equipment failure or disasters of any kind, coupling Neverfail’s SaaS 
solutions with OnRamp’s disaster recovery solutions is an excellent way to ensure total business continuity,” 
stated OnRamp Chief Architect John Thurik. By leveraging Neverfail’s IT continuity management software for 
applications running on the dedicated hardware housed within one of OnRamp’s data center facilities, the two 
companies can collectively ensure the safety of critical IT operations for their customers. 

About OnRamp 
OnRamp was founded in 1994 in Austin, TX. As one of Texas’ first Internet Operations companies, OnRamp’s 
history is rooted in providing reliable and secure connectivity that enables distributed computing. Today, OnRamp 
is a Data Center operations company that delivers a full suite of cloud computing, high security hosting, 
colocation, and disaster recovery services backed by Full7Layer Support, to help customers build, deploy and 
manage Data Center operations at each and every layer.  

As an SSAE 16 SOC I Type II certified, PCI Level 1 and HIPAA audited company, OnRamp’s state-of-the-art 
facilities feature the highest levels of security, redundancy, reliability and technical expertise with round-the-clock 
security and maintenance from a team of on-site network engineers.  OnRamp specializes in assisting customers 
that interact with sensitive data by ensuring adherence to rigorous compliance standards including HIPAA. 

For more information, call (888) 667-2660 or email sales@onr.com or visit www.onr.com  

http://www.onr.com/disaster-recovery/
http://onr.com/full7layer-support/
http://www.onr.com/private-clouds/
http://onr.com/secure-server-hosting/
http://www.onr.com/colocation/
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About Neverfail 

Neverfail is a leading global IT continuity management company. Neverfail’s software helps thousands of 
customers around the world rest easier at night by providing continuous insight in to which IT infrastructure 
supports each business service, protecting critical applications against downtime and assuring that disaster 
recovery plans will always work. For more information, visit: www.neverfailgroup.com. 
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