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OnRamp Showcases Channel Partner Program at XChange 2015 Conference 

AUSTIN, TX – OnRamp, an industry leading high security and hybrid hosting provider with data center facilities in Austin, 
TX and Raleigh, NC, announced today its sponsorship of The Channel Company’s (CRN) XChange 2015 Conference. 
This event, taking place August 9th-11th in Washington, D.C., will bring together IT decision makers and solution providers 
for product demonstrations, educational sessions from leading industry speakers, and networking opportunities. OnRamp 
will attend to showcase the company’s best-in-class data center solutions and to form partnerships with MSPs (managed 
service providers), ISVs (independent software vendors), and VARs (value added resellers) who are interested in 
capitalizing on the fast growing hybrid hosting market.  

Since establishing the OnRamp Channel Partner Program in 2013, the company has received numerous accolades from 
CRN. OnRamp was named to the Channel Partner Guide’s 5-Star Security Vendors, 5-Star Cloud Vendors, and 5-Star 
Storage Vendors lists in 2014, as well as the MSP 500 Hosting 100 list in both 2014 and 2015.  

“We understand that partners want to work with companies that, in addition to providing a variety of services and a focus 
on customer support, are easy to do business with…and OnRamp is just that,” stated Senior Director of OnRamp’s 
Channel Partner Program, Drew Jenkins. “Much of the success we’ve gained from our channel partner program comes in 
the breadth and depth of the services we offer as a provider of colocation, managed hosting, and cloud delivered services, 
our focus on compliance, and in our approach to working with our partners to make them successful.”  

Several members of the OnRamp team will attend the 20th Annual XChange 2015 Conference to educate attendees on 
the benefits of joining the OnRamp Channel Partner Program. In addition to being available for walkup visits in the 
solution pavilion Booth #408, OnRamp will be accepting scheduled one-on-one appointments on a first come, first serve 
basis. To reserve an appointment window, contact partners@onr.com.  

For additional information regarding this event, visit: http://www.xchange-events.com/xch15/  

About OnRamp 
OnRamp provides computing infrastructure for companies that require high levels of security and availability. As an SSAE 
16 SOC II audited, PCI and HIPAA compliant company, OnRamp operates multiple enterprise class data centers to 
deploy hybrid solutions built on cloud-delivered computing capacity, managed hosting and colocation services. OnRamp 
specializes in working with companies to ensure compliance in the healthcare, financial services and other industries with 
high security needs, helping them meet the rigorous compliance requirements associated with HIPAA, PCI, SOX, FISMA 
and FERPA. http://onr.com  
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