
 
Access to New Big Data Sources Improves the Public Awareness of People in the News 
 
Radaris Public Records and Background Reports Enable Verification of Political Players, Business Leaders 
and Voter Identity 
 
Over the past year, the American public has been introduced to dozens of new names of people who 
influence the country and who will in the coming years; including Jill Stein, Debby Wasserman Shultz, 
Steve Bannon and now Rex Tillerson. Radaris has made the public records on all these people, and 
everyone you already now, organized, easily accessible and searchable. 
 
The need to verify a person’s identity and history has been growing over recent years. The causes range 
from online dating becoming the norm and the growth of the sharing economy in peer-to-peer online 
marketplaces, to frequent news stories that make us all a little more curious about our neighbors and 
co-workers. These have added to existing demand from people who are looking for old classmates, long-
lost relatives and new friends. 
 
Here are just a few of the new and notable names that people across the country have been researching 
in recent months. Jill Stein, the unknown Green Party candidate who pushed for recount of votes in 
Pennsylvania, Wisconsin and Michigan. Debby Wasserman Shultz the Congresswoman from Florida and 
highly embarrassed former chairperson of the Democratic National Committee. Stephen K. Bannon 
executive chairman of Breitbart News and chief strategist and Senior Counselor to the President-elect 
Donald Trump. And now, Rex W. Tillerson, CEO of Exxon Mobil.  
 
Radaris is uniquely able to meet the needs of everyone who needs to be better informed because of its 
aggregation of Big Data sources into easily discoverable, free identity profiles. These profiles allow users 
to see pictures of the people they are searching for, along the most recent contact information such as 
phone numbers and addresses without paying for a full report. Clearly, with these latest sales results, 
the Radaris public records search engine is meeting the new demand for the most current and accurate 
data available.  
 
Find all the interesting details about any person you’re curious about today, and see what everyone else 
has been enjoying at Radaris.com. 
 
 
About Radaris 
Radaris (https://radaris.com/) is a public records search engine.  We search the web for profile 
information and references, then combine it with national public data records to help anyone find the 
people they live and interact with across their community. 
 
Radaris provides free public profiles along with premium background checks, contact information 
reports and other information tools. 
 
Radaris helps you get to know your community in a more honest, transparent way than ever before. 
 
Radaris is not a consumer reporting agency as defined by the Fair Credit Reporting Act (FCRA). This site 
should not be used to make decisions about employment, tenant screening, or any purpose covered by 
the FCRA. 
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