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123 S. Royal St., Alexandria, VA 22314 

Concourse Federal Group Named to Inc. Magazine’s 
Vet100 List 
 
DC-area company ranked among 100 Fastest-Growing Veteran-Owned Businesses  

WASHINGTON (January 17, 2020) –  Concourse Federal Group has been named to the 
annual Vet100 list — a compilation of the nation’s fastest growing veteran-owned businesses. 
The ranking, created in partnership with Inc. magazine and Syracuse University's Institute for 
Veterans and Military Families (IVMF), was born out of the Inc. 5000 list of the fastest-growing 
private companies based in the U.S.  

Both distinctions are considered hallmarks of entrepreneurial success.  
 
Concourse provides a full-service advisory group that offers solutions for their clients’ most 
difficult challenges. Concourse has more than ten years of experience providing services to 
federal clients in architecture and engineering, real estate, technology and management 
consulting. Concourse was nominated Best Small Business of the Year by Veteran Affairs VISN 
22 and has served several federal clients. Concourse has also dedicated more than 50,000 
hours serving the nation’s veterans.  

“Business growth is a real economic driver in this country and the fact is that most of the new 
jobs in the economy — over 87 percent — are created by private businesses,” says Eric 
Schurenberg, CEO of Mansueto Ventures, publisher of Inc. Magazine. “Veteran entrepreneurs 
contribute their share to the job story, employing over 5.5 million. They deserve to be 
recognized for their continued service to the country.” 
 
“Military experience provides veteran entrepreneurs with skills and knowledge we know to be 
valuable in the business world,” said Mike Haynie, Syracuse University Vice Chancellor and 
IVMF Founder and Executive Director. “The growth of this year’s list is a hopeful and inspiring 
indication of how important and valuable veteran entrepreneurs are to our society and economy. 
These businessmen and women not only served in defense of our collective freedom and 
security, they now continue to serve by bettering the economies in their communities and across 
the country. We are proud to partner again with Inc. magazine and are grateful for their efforts to 
shine a spotlight on the success of veteran-owned businesses.” 
  
The Vet100 list will be announced on March 7 in Dallas at the Vet100 Awards dinner during 
IVMF’s Veteran EDGE national conference. EDGE is the first-of-its-kind coalition of large 
companies supporting the success of veteran-owned businesses, connecting them with 
entrepreneurial education, training, resources and networking opportunities. For more 
information on the Inc. Vet100 list, visit https://ivmf.syracuse.edu/Vet100/ 

 

About Concourse Federal Group 

Concourse Federal Group is a certified Service-Disabled Veteran-Owned Small Business 
(SDVOSB) that provides full-service consulting and aspires to be the standard of excellence. 
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Concourse has been providing the federal government professional services in Architecture & 
Engineering, Real Estate, Technology, and Management Consulting to clients nationwide since 
2009. Concourse also provides solutions in cyber-security, real estate portfolio management, 
transition planning & medical facility outfitting, and healthcare planning. To learn more about 
Concourse Federal Group, visit http://concoursefederal.com/home.  

 

About Inc. and the Inc. 5000 

Founded in 1979 and acquired in 2005 by Mansueto Ventures, Inc. is the only major brand 
dedicated exclusively to owners and managers of growing private companies, with the aim to 
deliver real solutions for today's innovative company builders. For more information, visit 
http://www.inc.com. 

The Inc. 5000 is a list of the fastest-growing private companies in the U.S. Now in its 39th year, 
this prestigious list of the nation's most successful private companies has become the hallmark 
of entrepreneurial success. 

 

About Syracuse University’s Institute for Veterans and Military Families  

Syracuse University’s Institute for Veterans and Military Families (IVMF) is the first 
interdisciplinary national institute in higher education focused on the social, economic, education 
and policy issues impacting veterans and their families. Through its professional staff and 
experts, the IVMF delivers leading programs in career, vocational, and entrepreneurship 
education and training, while also conducting actionable research, policy analysis and program 
evaluations. The IVMF also supports communities through collective impact efforts that enhance 
delivery and access to services and care. For more information, visit ivmf.syracuse.edu. 

--- 
 
Media Contact: Geoffrey Perkins (gperkins@concoursefederal.com)  
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